Bid Summary - PE Uniform Bid Opening Monday, March 14, 2022 @ 2:30 p.m.

We Print Depot FSP Designs Warehouse Direct Inc BSN Sports Ambassador Athletic Apparel
Chicago, IL (No Notary) Monrovia, CA DesPlaines, IL Dallas, TX Arlington Heights, IL
ADDISON TRAIL
Item #1 - Shirts Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
M 360 9.20 3,312.00 5.00 1,800.00 4.10 1,476.00 5.33 1,918.80 4.16 1,497.60
L 100 10.60 1,060.00 5.00 500.00 4.10 410.00 5.33 533.00 4.16 416.00
XL 100 10.60 1,060.00 5.00 500.00 4.10 410.00 5.33 533.00 4.16 416.00
Item #2 - Shorts
S 450 10.63 4,783.50 7.00 3,150.00 7.33 3,298.50 9.73 4,378.50 6.05 2,722.50
M 150 11.33 1,699.50 7.00 1,050.00 7.33 1,099.50 9.73 1,459.50 6.05 907.50
L 100 11.33 1,133.00 7.00 700.00 7.33 733.00 9.73 973.00 6.05 605.00
WILLOWBROOK
Item #3 - Shirts
S 300 9.19 2,757.00 5.00 1,500.00 3.94 1,182.00 5.33 1,599.00 4.02 1,206.00
] 500 9.19 4,595.00 5.00 2,500.00 3.94 1,970.00 5.33 2,665.00 4.02 2,010.00
L 250 9.19 2,297.00 5.00 1,250.00 3.94 985.00 5.33 1,332.50 4.02 1,005.00
XL 200 9.89 1,978.00 5.00 1,250.00 3.94 788.00 5.33 1,066.00 4.02 804.00
XXL 5 12.99 64.95 No Bid 9.04 45.20 5.33 26.65 6.10 30.50
Item #4- Shorts
S 100 10.69 1,069.00 7.00 700.00 7.35 735.00 9.73 973.00 6.03 603.00
] 250 9.99 2,497.50 7.00 1,750.00 7.35 1,837.50 9.73 2,432.50 6.03 1,507.50
L 100 10.69 1,069.00 7.00 700.00 7.35 735.00 9.73 973.00 6.03 603.00
XL 100 10.69 1,069.00 7.00 700.00 7.35 735.00 9.73 973.00 6.03 603.00
XXL 10 11.84 118.40 7.00 70.00 9.05 90.50 9.73 97.30 6.03 60.30
Item #5 - Yoga Pants
S 5 12.06 60.30 14.00 70.00 No Bid No Bid 10.27 51.35
] 5 12.06 60.30 14.00 70.00 No Bid No Bid 10.27 51.35
TOTAL $30,683.45 $18,260.00 $16,530.20 $21,933.75 $15,099.60
Lead Time for Delivery 7 Days 15-20 Days or Sooner 15 Days 21 Days 30 Days
R:::er 7 Days 15-20 Days or Sooner 15 Days 21 Days 15 Days
Pricing held for full year Yes Yes No Yes No
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