Chromebooks Bid Opened Monday March 4, 2024 ; 10:00 am

Item 1: Lenovo 300E-Touch Chromebook with Integrated Pen
Item 2: Google Chrome OS Management License
Item 3: Dell 3110 2-in-1- Touch Chromebook with Targus Active
Sylus for Notebook
Item 4: Dell 3110-Chromebook
Item 5: Item 5 - Dell 3110 2-in-1 - Touch Chromebook with Targus
Logitech Pen Rechargeable USI Stylus Designed for Learning
Quantity || Item# Unit Price Total
XBS Midwest 1200 1 $352.10 $422,520.00
Bolingbrook, IL 1200 2 $29.99 $35,988.00
1200 3 $342.18 $410,616.00
1200 4 $222.22 $266,664.00
No Addendum 1200 5 $0.00
$1,135,788.00
Hypertech USA 1200 1 $338.93 $406,716.00
Tempe AZ 1200 2 $30.21 $36,252.00
1200 3 $399.85 $479,820.00
1200 4 $233.69 $280,428.00
1200 5 No Bid $0.00
$1,203,216.00
Virtucom 1200 1 $321.00 $385,200.00
Peachtree Corners. GA 1200 2 $30.00 $36,000.00
1200 3 $452.50 $543,000.00
1200 4 $253.00 $303,600.00
No Addendum 1200 5 $0.00
$1,267,800.00
Staples 1200 1 $317.70 $381,240.00
Deerfiled Beach, FL 1200 2 $30.60 $36,720.00
1200 3 No Bid $0.00
1200 4 $254.89 $305,868.00
1200 5 $450.13 $540,156.00
$1,263,984.00
Bright Centra 1200 1 $298.00 $357,600.00
South San Francisco, CA 1200 2 $29.15 $34,980.00
1200 3 $427.75 $513,300.00
1200 4 $291.00 $349,200.00
1200 5 $450.00 $540,000.00
$1,795,080.00




Taza Supplies 1200 1 No Bid $0.00
South Holland, IL 1200 2 No Bid $0.00
1200 3 $628.00 $753,600.00
1200 4 $337.00 $404,400.00
No Addendum 1200 5 $0.00
$1,158,000.00
Y & S Technologies 1200 1 $318.29 $381,948.00
Brooklyn, NY 1200 2 $29.08 $34,896.00
1200 3 No Bid $0.00
1200 4 No Bid $0.00
1200 5 No Bid $0.00
$416,844.00
CDW Government 1200 1 $302.91 $363,492.00
Vernon Hills, IL 1200 2 $29.65 $35,580.00
1200 3 No Bid $0.00
1200 4 $235.71 $282,852.00
1200 5 No Bid $0.00
$681,924.00
The Repair Depot 1200 1 $310.00 $372,000.00
stillwater, OK 1200 2 $29.70 $35,640.00
1200 3 No Bid $0.00
LATE: Received 3/5/24 1200 4 No Bid $0.00
1200 5 No Bid $0.00

$407,640.00
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