

Bid Summary - PE Uniform Bid Opening Tuesday, February 18, 2020 @ 3:30 p.m.

				Riddell		All Star Custom Apparel & Design		Sunburst Sport Wear		BSN Sports		Express Press		A & R Screening		Adwear & Specialty of Texas		Eagle Group		Sport Decal Inc		World of Promotions Inc		Premium Customer Solutions		
				North Ridgeville, OH		Henrietta, NY		Glendale Heights, IL		Dallas, TX		Springfield, MO			Crestwood, IL		Houston, TX		Columbus, IN		Spring Grove, IL		Elk GroveVillage, IL		Reno, NV	
ADDISON TRAIL																										
Item #1 - Shirts			Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price			Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		
S	500		5.66	2,830.00	4.01	2,005.00	2.24	1,120.00	4.75	2,375.00	3.60	1,800.00	2.34		1,170.00	2.25	1,125.00	4.60	2,300.00	3.49	1,745.00	3.90	1,950.00	4.98	2,490.00	
M	300		5.66	1,698.00	4.01	1,203.00	2.24	672.00	4.75	1,425.00	3.60	1,080.00	2.34		702.00	2.25	675.00	4.60	1,380.00	3.49	1,047.00	3.90	1,170.00	4.98	1,494.00	
L	200		5.66	1,132.00	4.01	802.00	2.24	448.00	4.75	950.00	3.60	720.00	2.34		468.00	2.25	450.00	4.60	920.00	3.49	698.00	3.90	780.00	4.98	996.00	
XL	50		5.66	283.00	4.01	200.50	2.24	112.00	4.75	237.50	3.60	180.00	2.34		117.00	2.25	112.50	4.60	230.00	3.49	174.50	3.90	195.00	4.98	249.00	
XXL	0		7.66	0.00	5.82	0.00	4.18	0.00		0.00		0.00	4.19		0.00		0.00		0.00	3.49	0.00		0.00	6.81	0.00	
XXXL	0		8.66	0.00	7.29	0.00		0.00		0.00		0.00	4.19		0.00		0.00		0.00	3.49	0.00		0.00	8.35	0.00	
Item #2 - Shorts																										
S	200		7.69	1,538.00	7.46	1,492.00	5.50	1,100.00	7.32	1,464.00	6.87	1,374.00	5.30	1,060.00	5.07	1,014.00	6.10	1,220.00	6.00	1,200.00	7.933	1,586.60	8.25	1,650.00		
M	500		7.69	3,845.00	7.46	3,730.00	5.50	2,750.00	7.32	3,660.00	6.87	3,435.00	5.30	2,650.00	5.07	2,535.00	6.10	3,050.00	6.00	3,000.00	7.933	3,966.50	8.25	4,125.00		
L	300		7.69	2,307.00	7.46	2,238.00	5.50	1,650.00	7.32	2,196.00	6.87	2,061.00	5.30	1,590.00	5.07	1,521.00	6.10	1,830.00	6.00	1,800.00	7.933	2,379.90	8.25	2,475.00		
XL	100		7.69	769.00	7.46	746.00	5.50	550.00	7.32	732.00	6.87	687.00	5.30	530.00	5.07	507.00	6.10	610.00	6.00	600.00	7.933	793.30	8.25	825.00		
XXL	0		9.69	0.00	8.46	0.00	6.50	0.00	7.32	0.00		0.00	5.30	0.00		0.00		0.00	6.00	0.00		0.00	9.64	0.00		
XXXL	0		10.69	0.00	9.46	0.00	7.50	0.00	7.32	0.00		0.00	7.15	0.00		0.00		0.00	6.00	0.00		0.00	11.26	0.00		
Item #3 - Sweatpants																										
S	48		12.85	616.80	12.66	607.68	8.18	392.64	14.50	696.00	8.60	412.80	8.35	400.80	7.53	361.44	10.90	523.20	14.49	695.52	11.355	545.04	12.15	583.20		
M	0		12.85	0.00	12.66	0.00	8.18	0.00		0.00		0.00	8.35	0.00		0.00		0.00	14.49	0.00	11.356	0.00	12.15	0.00		
L	0		12.85	0.00	12.66	0.00	8.18	0.00		0.00		0.00	8.35	0.00		0.00		0.00	14.49	0.00	11.357	0.00	12.15	0.00		
XL	0		12.85	0.00	12.66	0.00	8.18	0.00		0.00		0.00	8.35	0.00		0.00		0.00	14.49	0.00	11.358	0.00	12.15	0.00		

Bid Summary - PE Uniform Bid Opening Tuesday, February 18, 2020 @ 3:30 p.m.

				Riddell		All Star Custom Apparel & Design		Sunburst Sport Wear		BSN Sports		Express Press		A & R Screening		Adwear & Specialty of Texas		Eagle Group		Sport Decal Inc		World of Promotions Inc		Premium Customer Solutions	
				North Ridgeville, OH		Henrietta, NY		Glendale Heights, IL		Dallas, TX		Springfield, MO		Crestwood, IL		Houston, TX		Columbus, IN		Spring Grove, IL		Elk GroveVillage, IL		Reno, NV	
WILLOWBROOK																									
Item #5 - Shirts																									
S	250		10.66	2,665.00	4.07	1,017.50	2.24	560.00	4.75	1,187.50	3.60	900.00	2.34	585.00	2.23	557.50	4.60	1,150.00	3.99	997.50	4.814	1,203.50	4.98	1,245.00	
M	200		10.66	2,132.00	4.07	814.00	2.24	448.00	4.75	950.00	3.60	720.00	2.34	468.00	2.23	446.00	4.60	920.00	3.99	798.00	4.815	963.00	4.98	996.00	
L	100		10.66	1,066.00	4.07	407.00	2.24	224.00	4.75	475.00	3.60	360.00	2.34	234.00	2.23	223.00	4.60	460.00	3.99	399.00	4.816	481.60	4.98	498.00	
XL	50		10.66	533.00	4.07	203.50	2.24	112.00	4.75	237.50	3.60	180.00	2.34	117.00	2.23	111.50	4.60	230.00	3.99	199.50	4.817	240.85	4.98	249.00	
XXL	25		12.66	316.50	5.88	147.00	4.18	104.50	4.75	118.75		0.00	4.19	104.75	2.23	55.75	6.00	150.00	5.99	149.75	6.624	165.60	6.81	170.25	
XXXL	0		13.66	0.00	7.35	0.00	5.53	0.00		0.00		0.00	4.19	0.00	4.23	0.00		0.00	3.99	0.00		0.00	8.35	0.00	
Item #6 - Shorts																									
S	50		7.69	384.50	7.60	380.00	5.50	275.00	7.32	366.00	6.87	343.50	5.30	265.00	5.07	253.50	6.10	305.00	6.00	300.00	8.218	410.90	8.25	412.50	
M	150		7.69	1,153.50	7.60	1,140.00	5.50	825.00	7.32	1,098.00	6.87	1,030.50	5.30	795.00	5.07	760.50	6.10	915.00	6.00	900.00	8.219	1,232.85	8.25	1,237.50	
L	50		7.69	384.50	7.60	380.00	5.50	275.00	7.32	366.00	6.87	343.50	5.30	265.00	5.07	253.50	6.10	305.00	6.00	300.00	8.220	411.00	8.25	412.50	
XL	0		7.69	0.00	7.60	0.00	5.50	0.00	7.32	0.00	6.87	0.00	5.30	0.00		0.00		0.00	6.00	0.00	8.221	0.00	8.25	0.00	
XXL	5		9.69	48.45	8.60	43.00	6.50	32.50	7.32	36.60		No Bid	5.30	26.50		No Bid	8.10	40.50	8.00	40.00	9.828	49.14	9.64	48.20	
XXXL	5		10.69	53.45	9.60	48.00	7.50	37.50	7.32	36.60		No Bid	7.15	35.75		No Bid	8.10	40.50	9.00	45.00	11.138	55.69	11.26	56.30	
Item #7 - Yoga Pants																									
S	15		19.60	294.00	14.24	213.60	11.25	168.75	20.50	307.50	7.21	108.15	11.25	168.75	14.39	215.85	17.99	269.85	20.49	307.35	10.68	160.20	18.25	273.75	
M	10		19.60	196.00	14.24	142.40	11.25	112.50	20.50	205.00	7.21	72.10	11.25	112.50	14.39	143.90	17.99	179.90	20.49	204.90	10.68	106.80	18.25	182.50	
Lead Time for Delivery				30		14		15		12		17		15		15-25		15		7-10		20		14	
Re-order time				30		14		10		12		17		10		10-May		15		5-7		15		14	
Pricing held for full year				Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
	TOTAL			\$24,245.70		\$17,960.18		\$11,969.39		\$19,119.95		\$15,807.55		\$11,865.05		\$11,321.94		\$17,028.95		\$15,601.02		\$18,847.47		\$20,668.70	