PE Uniform Bid Results - Opened March 12, 2013 @ 1:30 p.m.

ADDISON TRAIL
Auther?tic Eagle Group Fitness Wear, Graphic Marathon Silk Screen Sunburst Top Notth WorId.of
Promotions Inc. Edge Sportswear Express Sportswear Silkscreening Promotions
Carmcizhael, Columbus, IN Glenview, IL Carroll, IA Blue Island, IL Tinley Park, IL HGeliegr:::,l‘lsL Chicago, IL f/lill(laGgrsvli
Item #1 |Shirts - Sport Grey Color - GILDAN
S 648 2.60 $1,684.80 3.59 $2,326.32 2.15 $1,393.20 3.14 $2,034.72 2.49 | $1,613.52 2.80 $1,814.40 2.44 $1,581.12 2.58 $1,671.84 3.42 $2,216.16
M 1008 || 2.60 | $2,620.80 3.59 | $3,618.72 2.15 $2,167.20 3.14 | $3,165.12 || 2.49| $2,509.92 2.80 | $2,822.40 244 | $2,459.52 2.58 $2,600.64 3.42 | $3,447.36
L 720 2.60 $1,872.00 3.59 $2,584.80 2.15 $1,548.00 3.14 $2,260.80 2.49 | $1,792.80 2.80 $2,016.00 2.44 $1,756.80 2.58 $1,857.60 3.42 $2,462.40
XL 504 2.60 $1,310.40 3.59 $1,809.36 2.15 $1,083.60 3.14 $1,582.56 2.49 | $1,254.96 2.80 $1,411.20 244 $1,229.76 2.58 $1,300.32 3.42 $1,723.68
XXL 72 2.60 $187.20 5.00 $360.00 3.48 $250.56 4.44 $319.68 3.52 $253.44 3.95 $284.40 3.58 $257.76 2.80 $201.60 4.98 $358.56
XXXL 72 2.60 $187.20 5.90 $424.80 3.48 $250.56 4.44 $319.68 3.52 $253.44 3.95 $284.40 3.58 $257.76 2.80 $201.60 4.98 $358.56
Total $7,862.40 $11,124.00 $6,693.12 $9,682.56 $7,678.08 $8,632.80 $7,542.72 $7,833.60 $10,566.72
Item #2 Shorts - Badger #7209 - Navy
S 672 6.79] $4,562.88 425 | $2,856.00 5.94 $3,991.68 5.25 | $3,528.00 || 5.75| $3,864.00 5.65 $3,796.80 6.14 | $4,126.08 5.70 $3,830.40 7.89 | $5,302.08
M 528 6.79] $3,585.12 425 | $2,244.00 5.94 $3,136.32 5.25 | $2,772.00 || 5.75| $3,036.00 5.65 $2,983.20 6.14 | $3,241.92 5.70 $3,009.60 7.89 | $4,165.92
L 192 6.79] $1,303.68 4.25 $816.00 5.94 $1,140.48 5.25 | $1,008.00 || 5.75| $1,104.00 5.65 $1,084.80 6.14 | $1,178.88 5.70 $1,094.40 7.89 | $1,514.88
XL 192 6.79] $1,303.68 4.25 $816.00 5.94 $1,140.48 5.25 | $1,008.00 || 5.75| $1,104.00 5.65 $1,084.80 6.14 | $1,178.88 5.70 $1,094.40 7.89 | $1,514.88
XXL | 144 6.79] $977.76 5.25 $756.00 7.14 $1,028.16 5.25 $756.00 6.75 $972.00 6.65 $957.60 7.28 | $1,048.32 6.70 $964.80 9.14 | $1,316.16
XXXL | 48 6.79] $325.92 6.25 $300.00 8.34 $400.32 7.75 $372.00 7.75 $372.00 7.65 $367.20 8.68 $416.64 7.70 $369.60 11.34( $544.32
Total $12,059.04 $7,788.00 $10,837.44 $9,444.00 $10,452.00 $10,274.40 $11,190.72 $10,363.20 $14,358.24
Item #3 Sweat Pants - Jerzees J. Navy
S 150 7.86| $1,179.00 10.90| $1,635.00 7.50 $1,125.00 8.65 $1,297.50 6.57 $985.50 6.75 $1,012.50 6.44 $966.00 6.51 $976.50 10.49 | $1,573.50
M 100 7.86] $786.00 10.90 | $1,090.00 7.50 $750.00 8.65 $865.00 657 $657.00 6.75 $675.00 6.44 $644.00 6.51 $651.00 10.49 | $1,049.00
L 150 7.86] $1,179.00 10.90| $1,635.00 7.50 $1,125.00 8.65 | $1,297.50 6.57| $985.50 6.75 $1,012.50 6.44 $966.00 6.51 $976.50 10.49| $1,573.50
XL 50 7.86] $393.00 10.90 $545.00 7.50 $375.00 8.65 $432.50 6.57| $328.50 6.75 $337.50 6.44 $322.00 6.51 $325.50 10.49| $524.50
Total $3,537.00 $4,905.00 $3,375.00 8.65 | $3,892.50 $2,956.50 $3,037.50 $2,898.00 $2,929.50 $4,720.50
Item #4 Yoga Pants - Soffee 96V - Navy Blue
M 50 13.19 $659.50 14.90 $745.00 12.42 $621.00 11.38 $569.00 no bid $0.00 14.00 $700.00 12.74 $637.00 11.65 $582.50 14.64 $732.00
Total $659.50 $745.00 $621.00 $569.00 no bid $0.00 $700.00 $637.00 $582.50 $732.00
WILLOWBROOK
Authentic Fitness Wear, Graphic Marathon Silk Screen Sunburst Top Notch World of
Promotions Eagle Group Inc. Edge Sportswear Express Sportswear Silkscreening Promotions
Carmichael, Columbus, IN Glenview, IL Carroll, IA Blue Island, IL Tinley Park, IL Glfandale Chicago, IL El_k Grove
CA Heights, IL Village, IL
Item #5  Shirts - Sport Grey Color - GILDAN
S 175 2.81 $491.75 3.69 $645.75 2.15 $376.25 3.14 $549.50 2.49 $435.75 2.80 $490.00 2.44 $427.00 2.58 $451.50 4.19 $733.25
M 200 2.81 $562.00 3.69 $738.00 2.15 $430.00 3.14 $628.00 2.49 $498.00 2.80 $560.00 2.44 $488.00 2.58 $516.00 4.19 $838.00
L 150 2.81 $421.50 3.69 $553.50 2.15 $322.50 3.14 $471.00 2.49 $373.50 2.80 $420.00 2.44 $366.00 2.58 $387.00 4.19 $628.50
XL 50 2.81 $140.50 3.69 $184.50 2.15 $107.50 3.14 $157.00 2.49 $124.50 2.80 $140.00 2.44 $122.00 2.58 $129.00 4.19 $209.50
2XL 20 2.81 $56.20 4.50 $90.00 3.48 $69.60 4.44 $88.80 3.52 $70.40 3.95 $79.00 3.58 $71.60 2.80 $56.00 5.66 $113.20
Total $1,671.95 $2,211.75 $1,305.85 $1,894.30 $1,502.15 $1,689.00 $1,474.60 $1,539.50 $2,522.45
Item #6 Shorts - Badger #7209 - Black
S 150 || 7.26 | $1,089.00 || 4.25 | $637.50 5.94 $891.00 5.25 $787.50 | 5.75| $862.50 5.65 $847.50 6.14 | $921.00 5.70 $855.00 8.59 | $1,288.50
M 200 7.26 | $1,452.00 4.25 $850.00 5.94 $1,188.00 5.25 | $1,050.00 [[ 5.75| $1,150.00 5.65 $1,130.00 6.14 | $1,228.00 5.70 $1,140.00 8.59 | $1,718.00
L 120 7.26 $871.20 4.25 $510.00 5.94 $712.80 5.25 $630.00 5.75 $690.00 5.65 $678.00 6.14 $736.80 5.70 $684.00 8.59 | $1,030.80
XL 22 7.26 $159.72 4.25 $93.50 5.94 $130.68 5.25 $115.50 5.75 $126.50 5.65 $124.30 6.14 $135.08 5.70 $125.40 8.59 $188.98
2XL 15 7.26 $108.90 5.25 $78.75 7.14 $107.10 5.25 $78.75 6.75 $101.25 6.65 $99.75 7.28 $109.20 6.70 $100.50 9.99 $149.85
Total $3,680.82 $2,169.75 $3,029.58 $2,661.75 $2,930.25 $2,879.55 $3,130.08 $2,904.90 $4,376.13
Item #7 Yoga Pants - Soffee 96V - Black
S 60]| 12.88 $772.80 14.90 $894.00 12.42 $745.20 11.38 $682.80 || no bid $0.00 14.00 $840.00 12.74| $764.40 11.65 $699.00 14.64| $878.40
M 50|l 12.88 $644.00 14.90 $745.00 12.42 $621.00 11.38 $569.00 || no bid $0.00 14.00 $700.00 12.74| $637.00 11.65 $582.50 14.64| $732.00
Total $1,416.80 $1,639.00 $1,366.20 $1,251.80 $0.00 $1,540.00 $1,401.40 $1,281.50 $1,610.40




