Chromebooks & Cases Bid Opened Tuesday February 15, 2022 @ 11:00 a.m.

Item 1: Dell 11 3100 Chromebook (210-ARJL)

Item 2: Google Chrome EDU Perpetual Licensing
Item 3: Chromebook Case

Alternate #1 Dell 11 3100 Chromebook (210-ARJIL)
Alternate # 2 Gumdrop Chromebook Case

Quantity Item# Unit Price Total
Ibenzer Inc
College Point. NY
1100 1 No Bid No Bid
1100 2 No Bid No Bid
Substiute: Ibenzer Hexpact Case 1100 3 $19.25 $21,175.00
1100 Alt#1 No Bid No Bid
1100 Alt#2 $19.25 $21,175.00
Riverside Technologies Inc
NSC. SD
Substitute Option 1: HP Chromebook 11A G8 EE 1100 1 $149.00 $163,900.00
Substitute Option 2: HP Chromebook 11MK G9 EE 1100 1 $212.00 $233,200.00
1100 2 $31.50 $34,650.00
1100 3 $19.00 $20,900.00
1100 Alt#1 NO BID NO BID
1100 Alt#2 $18.00 $19,800.00
Leepopo Corp
San Antonio. TX
1100 1 $280.71 $308,781.00
1100 2 $32.58 $35,838.00
1100 3 $24.14 $26,554.00
1100 Alt#1 $326.55 $359,205.00
1100 Alt#2 $24.14 $26,554.00
Princeton IT Services Inc
New York. NY
1100 1 $249.79 $274,769.00
1100 2 $30.75 $33,825.00
1100 3 $25.38 $27,918.00
1100 Alt#1 $291.03 $320,133.00
1100 Alt#2 $25.38 $27,918.00
Malor & Co Inc
New York. NY
1100 1 $199.11 $219,021.00
1100 2 $33.00 $36,300.00
1100 3 $26.61 $29,271.00
1100 Alt#1 $179.77 $197,747.00
1100 Alt#2 $36.61 $40,271.00




9 to 5 Computer
Jax Beach. FL

1100 1 No Bid No Bid
1100 2 No Bid No Bid
1100 3 $20.01 $22,011.00
1100 Alt#1 No Bid No Bid
1100 Alt#2 $20.01 $22,011.00

Brightcentra Inc

South San Francisco. CA
1100 1 $253.00 $278,300.00
1100 2 $28.95 $31,845.00
1100 3 $19.95 $21,945.00
1100 Alt#1 $279.00 $306,900.00
1100 Alt#2 $21.00 $23,100.00
Databit Inc
Mahwah. NJ

1100 1 $253.51 $278,861.00
1100 2 $29.80 $32,780.00
1100 3 $25.92 $28,512.00
1100 Alt#1 $325.29 $357,819.00
1100 Alt#2 $25.92 $28,512.00

Dell Technologies

Round Rock. TX
1100 1 $198.00 $217,800.00
1100 2 $31.00 $34,100.00
1100 3 $25.79 $28,369.00
1100 Alt#1 No Bid No Bid
1100 Alt#2 No Bid No Bid

CDW Government LLC

Vernon Hills. IL
1100 1 $239.95 $263,945.00
1100 2 $30.55 $33,605.00
1100 3 $17.47 $19,217.00
1100 Alt#1 No Bid No Bid
1100 Alt#2 No Bid No Bid

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC
Deerfield Beach. FL

1100 1 No Bid No Bid
1100 2 $30.61 $33,671.00
1100 3 No Bid No Bid
1100 Alt#1 $349.00 $384,780.00
1100 Alt#2 $19.38 $21,318.00

Item 1:Dell 11 3100 Chromebook (210-ARIJL) : Awarded to Dell Technologies
Item 2: Google Chrome EDU Perpetual Licensing : Awarded to Brightcentra Inc

Item 3: Chromebook Case : Awarded to CDW Government LLC
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