
Chromebook Bid Opened Friday  April 17, 2020 @ 10:00 a.m.
1A: Lenovo 100e Chromebook                                                  
1B: HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE                                         
1C:  Dell 3100 Chromebook                                                                    

Unit Price Total
 Vendor Quantity

Riverside Technologies Inc 1100 1A No Bid

1100 1B $198.00 $217,800.00

1100 1C No Bid

MicroAge 1100 1A $198.00 $217,800.00

1100 1B $275.00 $302,500.00

1100 1C $271.00 $298,100.00

Imagetec 1100 1A $198.13 $217,946.67

1100 1B $193.95 $213,343.59

1100 1C $271.18 $298,297.44

CDW Government LLC 1100 1A $185.24 $203,764.00

1100 1B $195.04 $214,544.00

1100 1C No Bid

Hypertec USA Inc 1100 1A $195.95 $215,545.00

1100 1B $248.62 $273,482.00

1100 1C $273.15 $300,465.00

Dell Marketing 1100 1A No Bid

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C $224.82 $247,302.00

IT Savvy 1100 1A $189.77 $208,747.00

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C No Bid

Y&S Technologies 1100 1A $187.00 $205,700.00

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C No Bid

Mvation Worlwide Inc 1100 1A $196.46 $216,106.00

1100 1B $265.75 $292,325.00

1100 1C $265.97 $292,567.00

Howard Technology Solutions 1100 1A No Bid

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C $277.00 $304,700.00

The Horus Group LLC 1100 1A $192.42 $211,662.00

1100 1B $279.12 $307,032.00

1100 1C $246.90 $271,590.00



SDF Professional Computers Inc 1100 1A $183.00 $201,300.00

1100 1B $250.00 $275,000.00

1100 1C No Bid

DHE Computer Systems LLC 1100 1A $197.82 $217,602.00

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C No Bid

Archangel Tablets LLC 1100 1A $187.15 $205,865.00

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C No Bid

Tiles in Style LLC DBA TAZA Supplies 1100 1A No Bid

1100 1B No Bid

1100 1C $314.00 $345,400.00

Firefly Computers 1100 1A $191.00 $210,100.00

1100 1B $249.00 $273,900.00

1100 1C No Bid
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