Technology Equipment Bid Opened Wednesday, April 27, 2016 @ 2:00 p.m.

CcDI CDW-G Insight Public MNJ Tech Netech OM Office Supply
Sector, Inc.
Markham, Vernon Hills, Buffalo Schiller Park, Mechanicsburg,
K Tempe, AZ
Ontario IL Grove, IL IL PA
Quantity
Item #1 - )
. 2 no bid 8,352.89 16,705.78( 6,292.37 | 12,584.74| 6,927.23 | 13,854.46| 6,461.88 | 12,923.76(6,810.00| 13,620.00
Cisco Router
Item #2 - i
2 6,399.00| 12,798.00 5,749.00 11,498.00( 5,560.59 |11,121.18| 5,231.04 | 10,462.08 no bid |5,140.00| 10,280.00
APC UPS
Item #3 - SAN -
EMC VNXe3200 1 no bid no bid 65,500.96 54,979.03 54,995.00 68,000.00
SOLUTION
Sentintel i SSI Supply
Technology SHi Summit Chain Services
Downers Grove,
L Somerset, NJ Eagan, MN Lombard, IL
Quantity
Item #1 —
. 2 5,982.00 11,964.00 | 5,773.01 | 11,546.02| 6,890.00 | 13,780.00| 7,008.37 | 14,016.74
Cisco Router
Item #2 -
2 5,593.00 11,186.00 | 5,677.00 | 11,354.00| 6,000.00 | 12,000.00| 5,612.56 | 11,225.12
APC UPS
Item #3 - SAN -
EMC VNXe3200 1 46,772.00 55,866.07 71,000.00 55,241.79
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