Bid Summary - PE Uniform Bid Opening Tuesday May 2, 2023 @ 10:30 a.m.

Late: Arrived at 10:59am
5/2/23

Late: Arrived at 10:59am
5/2/23

Ambassador Athletic

Ad-Wear & Specialty of

Apparel Marathon Sportswear BSN Sports Image First Uniforms Texas Triangle Sports Jonah's Enterprises American Soccer Company
Arlington Heights, IL Blue Island, IL Dallas, TX Englewood, NJ Houston, TX LaPuente, CA Brooklyn, NY Wilmington, CA
ADDISON TRAIL
Item #1 - Shirts Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
S 216 4.20 907.20 4.50 972.00 5.33 1,151.28 17.50 3,780.00 311 671.76 7.40 1,598.40 7.49 1,617.84 4.16 898.56
M 360 4.20 1,512.00 4.50 1,620.00 5.33 1,918.80 17.50 6,300.00 3.11 1,119.60 7.40 2,664.00 7.49 2,696.40 4.16 1,497.60
L 216 4.20 907.20 4.50 972.00 5.33 1,151.28 17.50 3,780.00 311 671.76 7.40 1,598.40 7.49 1,617.84 4.16 898.56
XL 100 4.20 420.00 4.50 450.00 5.33 533.00 17.50 1,750.00 3.11 311.00 7.40 740.00 10.19 1,019.00 4.16 416.00
XXL 50 5.80 290.00 6.50 325.00 5.33 266.50 19.50 975.00 5.11 255.50 8.75 437.50 9.17 458.50 4.16 208.00
Item #2 - Shorts
S 216 6.22 1,343.52 6.75 1,458.00 9.73 2,101.68 27.15 5,864.40 5.67 1,224.72 8.99 1,941.84 12.70 2,743.20 6.05 1,306.80
M 300 6.22 1,866.00 6.75 2,025.00 9.73 2,919.00 27.15 8,145.00 5.67 1,701.00 8.99 2,697.00 12.70 3,810.00 6.05 1,815.00
L 50 6.22 311.00 6.75 337.50 9.73 486.50 27.15 1,357.50 5.67 283.50 8.99 449.50 15.40 770.00 6.05 302.50
XXL 50 6.22 311.00 8.75 437.50 9.73 486.50 29.95 1,497.50 5.67 283.50 8.99 449.50 17.21 860.50 6.05 302.50
Item #3 - Sweatpants
S 48 12.50 600.00 16.50 792.00 No Bid 26.65 1,279.20 10.97 526.56 15.25 732.00 21.13 1,014.24 No Bid
WILLOWBROOK
Item #4 - Shirts
S 500 3.76 1,880.00 4.50 2,250.00 5.33 2,665.00 17.15 8,575.00 311 1,555.00 7.40 3,700.00 7.49 3,745.00 4.02 2,010.00
M 550 3.76 2,068.00 4.50 2,475.00 5.33 2,931.50 17.15 9,432.50 3.11 1,710.50 7.40 4,070.00 7.49 4,119.50 4.02 2,211.00
L 350 3.76 1,316.00 4.50 1,575.00 5.33 1,865.50 17.15 6,002.50 311 1,088.50 7.40 2,590.00 7.49 2,621.50 4.02 1,407.00
XL 200 3.76 752.00 4.50 900.00 5.33 1,066.00 17.15 3,430.00 3.11 622.00 7.40 1,480.00 7.49 1,498.00 4.02 804.00
XXL 10 5.36 53.60 6.50 65.00 5.33 53.30 19.50 195.00 5.11 51.10 8.75 87.50 17.61 176.10 4.02 40.20
XXXL 10 6.71 67.10 7.50 75.00 5.33 53.30 21.10 211.00 6.11 61.10 9.95 99.50 19.71 197.10 4.02 40.20
Item #5- Shorts
S 250 6.20 1,550.00 6.75 1,687.50 9.73 2,432.50 27.15 6,787.50 5.67 1,417.50 8.99 2,247.50 12.70 3,175.00 6.03 1,507.50
M 250 6.20 1,550.00 6.75 1,687.50 9.73 2,432.50 27.15 6,787.50 5.67 1,417.50 8.99 2,247.50 12.70 3,175.00 6.03 1,507.50
L 150 6.20 930.00 6.75 1,012.50 9.73 1,459.50 27.15 4,072.50 5.67 850.50 8.99 1,348.50 12.70 1,905.00 6.03 904.50
XL 150 6.20 930.00 6.75 1,012.50 9.73 1,459.50 27.15 4,072.50 5.67 850.50 8.99 1,348.50 12.70 1,905.00 6.03 904.50
XXL 20 6.20 124.00 8.75 175.00 9.73 194.60 29.95 599.00 5.67 113.40 8.99 179.80 22.41 448.20 6.03 120.60
XXXL 10 8.20 82.00 9.75 97.50 9.73 97.30 32.75 327.50 7.67 76.70 10.00 100.00 24.25 242.50 6.03 60.30
Item #6-Yoga Pants Out of Stock Item
S 25 No Bid 10.50 262.50 No Bid No Bid 6.59 164.75 25.50 637.50 31.99 799.75 No Bid
M 20 No Bid 10.50 210.00 No Bid No Bid 6.59 131.80 25.50 510.00 31.99 639.80 No Bid
L 15 No Bid 10.50 157.50 No Bid No Bid 6.59 98.85 25.50 382.50 31.99 479.85 No Bid
TOTAL $19,770.62 $23,031.50 $27,725.04 $85,221.10 $17,258.60 $34,336.94 $41,734.82 $19,162.82
Lead Time for Delivery 30 days 10 business days 21 days 21 days 15-20 days 20 days 30 days 20 days
Re-order time 15 days 7-10 days 21 days 10 days 7-10 days 10 days 30 days 10 days
Pricing held for full year No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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