
Chromebooks & Cases Bid Opened Tuesday March 21, 2023 ; 11:00 am

Quantity Item# Unit Price Total

DHE Computer Systems 1100 1 $298.65 $328,449.00

Centennial, CO 1100 2 $29.99 $32,989.00

1100 3 $20.05 $22,055.00

1100 Alt # 1 $327.69 $360,459.00

1100 Alt #2 $421.09 $463,199.00

1100 Alt # 3 $30.95 $34,045.00

1100 Alt # 4 $20.05 $22,055.00

CDW Government 1100 1 $261.00 $287,100.00

Vernon Hills, IL 1100 2 $29.89 $32,879.00

1100 3 $19.76 $21,736.00

1100 Alt # 1 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt #2 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt #2 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt # 4 No Bid No Bid 

Brightcentra 1100 1 $273.00 $300,300.00

San Francisco, CA 1100 2 $28.90 $31,790.00

1100 3 $19.95 $21,945.00

1100 Alt # 1 $310.00 $341,000.00

1100 Alt #2 $410.00 $451,000.00

1100 Alt # 3 N/A N/A

1100 Alt # 4 $19.95 $21,945.00

Tiles in Syle 1100 1 $338.78 $372,658.00

South Holland, IL 1100 2 $36.56 $40,216.00

1100 3 $36.00 $39,600.00

1100 Alt # 1 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt #2 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt # 3 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt # 4 No Bid No Bid 

Item 1: Dell 11 3110 (non-touch screen)                                               
Item 2: Google Chrome EDU Perpetual Licensing                           
Item 3: Dell 3110 Gumdrop Slimtech Cases                                                                            
Alternate #1 Dell 11 3110 Chromebook  (touch screen)                 
Alternate # 2 Chromebook 3110 2-in-1                                     
Alternate # 3 V7 USI Chromebook Active Stylus Pen                                                                                    



AKA Comp Solutions 1100 1 $195.00 $214,500.00

Chicago , IL 1100 2 $28.85 $31,735.00

1100 3 $17.00 $18,700.00

1100 Alt # 1 $317.10 $348,810.00

1100 Alt #2 $411.11 $452,221.00

1100 Alt # 3 $30.71 $33,781.00

1100 Alt # 4 $21.25 $23,375.00

Sunflower Lab LLC 1100 1 $309.45 $340,397.20

Hilliard, OH 1100 2 $30.42 $33,462.00

1100 3 $26.27 $28,897.00

1100 Alt # 1 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt #2 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt #3 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt # 4 No Bid No Bid 

LN2S Consulting  LLC 1100 1 $290.54 $319,594.00

O'Fallon, IL 1100 2 $30.42 $33,462.00

1100 3 $25.88 $28,468.00

1100 Alt # 1 $343.46 $377,806.00

1100 Alt #2 $452.67 $497,937.00

1100 Alt # 3 $35.64 $39,204.00

1100 Alt # 4 $26.12 $28,732.00

Archangel Education & Technology 1100 1 $236.39 $260,029.00

Miami Beach, FL 1100 2 $29.79 $32,769.00

1100 3 $20.18 $22,198.00

1100 Alt # 1 $244.76 $269,236.00

1100 Alt #2 $244.23 $268,653.00

1100 Alt # 3 $34.49 $37,939.00

1100 Alt # 4 $27.66 $30,426.00

Staples Contract & Commercial 1100 1 $240.87 $264,957.00

Deerfield Beach, FL 1100 2 $30.96 $34,056.00

1100 3 No Bid No Bid

1100 Alt # 1 $269.86 $296,846.00

1100 Alt #2 $320.00 $352,000.00

1100 Alt # 3 $31.71 $34,881.00

1100 Alt # 4 No Bid No Bid



Malor & Company 1100 1 $407.21 $447,931.00

New York, NY 1100 2 $29.77 $32,747.00

1100 3 $19.21 $21,131.00

1100 Alt # 1 $499.77 $549,747.00

1100 Alt #2 $299.77 $329,747.00

1100 Alt # 3 $100.00 $110,000.00

1100 Alt # 4 $19.21 $21,131.00

Ibenzer Inc 1100 1 No Bid No Bid 

1100 2 No Bid No Bid 

Substitution: 1100 3 $15.49 $17,039.00

1100 Alt # 1 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt #2 No Bid No Bid 

1100 Alt # 3 No Bid No Bid 

Substitution: 1100 Alt # 4 $15.49 $17,039.00
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