

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM				EXPERT CHEMICAL		HP PRODUCTS		INTERBORO		UNLIMITED WAREHOUSE		UNIPAK		VALDES	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y
1	Bathroom Tissue Brand: NPS Corp NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 12325	96/case	452 cases	NO BID		26.48		NO BID		47.43		NO BID		26.15	11,819.80
2	Bleach, Janitor Strength Brand: ID#	six 1 gal. /case	65 case	NO BID		7.87		NO BID		17.59		NO BID		6.49	421.85
3	Can Liners, Polyethylene .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon capacity Brand: ID#	100/case	545 cases	NO BID		NO BID		A: 10.48 B: 9.24 C: 7.48 D: 6.98		19.47		7.42 4,043.90		9.45	
4	Can Liners, Polyethylene .9 mil 30 x 36, 20-30 gallon capacity Brand: ID#	250/case	90 cases	NO BID		NO BID		A: 16.24 B: 13.34 C: 9.24 D: 8.24		19.40		12.88 1,159.20		14.02	
5	Can Liners, Polyethylene .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 7-10 gallon capacity Brand: ID#	500/case	15 cases	NO BID		NO BID		A: 10.24 B: 7.56 113.40 C: 7.56 D: 7.56		15.69		NO BID		NO BID	
6	Disinfectant spray Brand: ID#	12 oz can 6 per case	20 cases	23.84		13.64 272.80		NO BID		56.62		NO BID		NO BID	
7	Disinfectant wipes 70/container or better Brand: NOTE: Bid specs called for 12/cs @ 70/cs= 840 wipes. ID# Need 840 x 125 cases=105,000 wipes.	12 per case	125 cases 37 cases	51.00 1,887.00 240/container@12/cs 2,880 per case 0.01771 EACH		26.40 Clorox 75/container@6/cs 450 per case 0.05867 EACH		NO BID		27.84 75/container@12/cs 900 per case 0.03093 EACH		NO BID		23.00 85/container@6/cs 510 per case 0.04510 EACH	
8	Floor Cleaner, Grease & Oil Cleaner Brand: Diversey: Profi NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 4512759	4 gal/case	30 cases	NO BID		44.63		NO BID		36.45 1,093.50		NO BID		NO BID	
9	Floor Finish Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE ID#	5 gallon box	410 gallons	NO BID		10.94 4,485.40		NO BID		19.75		NO BID		NO BID	

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM				ALL AMERICAN POLY		CENTRAL POLY		DYNA PAK	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No
1	Bathroom Tissue Brand: NPS Corp NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 12325	96/case	452 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
2	Bleach, Janitor Strength Brand: ID#	six 1 gal. /case	65 case	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
3	Can Liners, Polyethylene .70 mil 43 x 48, 2 ply, 55 gallon capacity Brand: ID#	100/case	545 cases	10.75		11.80		11.56	
4	Can Liners, Polyethylene .9 mil 30 x 36, 20-30 gallon capacity Brand: ID#	250/case	90 cases	14.07		13.70		20.25	
5	Can Liners, Polyethylene .35 mil 22.5 x 24.5 7-10 gallon capacity Brand: ID#	500/case	15 cases	17.62		11.90		14.90	
6	Disinfectant spray Brand: ID#	12 oz can 6 per case	20 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
7	Disinfectant wipes 70/container or better Brand: NOTE: Bid specs called for 12/cs @ 70/cs= 840 wipes. ID# Need 840 x 125 cases=105,000 wipes.	12 per case	125 cases 37 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
8	Floor Cleaner, Grease & Oil Cleaner Brand: Diversey: Profi NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 4512759	4 gal/case	30 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
9	Floor Finish Brand: Johnson's Wax: Vectra NO SUBSTITUTE ID#	5 gallon box	410 gallons	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM					EXPERT CHEMICAL		HP PRODUCTS		INTERBORO		UNLIMITED WAREHOUSE		UNIPAK		VALDES	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL		Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y
10	Floor Sealer Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza NO SUBSTITUTE ID# _____	5 gallon box	35	gallons	NO BID		15.28	534.80	NO BID		45.95		NO BID		NO BID	
11 *	Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 14"X20" Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 51111 025901 *REJECT	10/case	40	cases	NO BID		110.34		NO BID		148.10		NO BID		NO BID	
12 *	Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep MAROON - 20" Brand: 3M NO SUBSTITUTE ID# _____ *REJECT	10/case	40	cases	NO BID		77.51		NO BID		98.41		NO BID		NO BID	
13	Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE ID# _____	100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	35	cases	NO BID		21.90	766.50	19.95 *SUBSTITUTED Medical Pride brand		62.60		NO BID		NO BID	
14	Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE Brand: PRO LINK VINYL NO SUBSTITUTE ID# _____	100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	40	cases	NO BID		21.90	876.00	19.95 *SUBSTITUTED Medical Pride brand		62.60		NO BID		NO BID	
15	Gloves, Disposable, WITH powder: LARGE Brand: _____ ID# _____	100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	20	cases	21.24	424.80	24.40		23.50		36.59		NO BID		NO BID	
16	Gloves, Disposable, WITH powder: EX-LARGE Brand: _____ ID# _____	100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	20	cases	21.24	424.80	24.40		23.50		36.59		NO BID		NO BID	
17	J-Fill Bath & Bowl Brand: Diversey CREW NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 3172650	2 - 84.5 oz containers /case	8	cases	NO BID		49.73	397.84	NO BID		128.50		NO BID		NO BID	
18	J-Fill Glass Cleaner Brand: Diversey GLANCE NO SUBSTITUTE ID# _____	2 - 84.5 oz containers /case	20	cases	NO BID		46.55		NO BID		41.65 833.00		NO BID		NO BID	
19 *	KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner Brand: KaiblooeY NO SUBSTITUTE ID# _____ *REJECT	4 gallons /case	20	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		76.65		NO BID		NO BID	

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM					ALL AMERICAN POLY		CENTRAL POLY		DYNA PAK	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION		PACK	TOTAL	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No
10	Floor Sealer Brand: Johnson's Wax: Plaza ID#	NO SUBSTITUTE	5 gallon box	35 gallons	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
11 *	Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep Brand: 3M ID# 51111 025901	MAROON - 14"X20" NO SUBSTITUTE	10/case	40 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
12 *	Floor Pads, Strip Surface Prep Brand: 3M ID#	MAROON - 20" NO SUBSTITUTE	10/case	40 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
13	Gloves, Disposable, without powder: LARGE Brand: PRO LINK VINYL ID#	NO SUBSTITUTE	100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	35 cases	NO BID		27.29 *SUBSTITUTED Sterile brand		NO BID	
14	Gloves, Disposable, without powder: EX-LARGE Brand: PRO LINK VINYL ID#	NO SUBSTITUTE	100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	40 cases	NO BID		27.29 *SUBSTITUTED Sterile brand		NO BID	
15	Gloves, Disposable, WITH powder: LARGE Brand: ID#		100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	20 cases	NO BID		Sterile brand 26.74		NO BID	
16	Gloves, Disposable, WITH powder: EX-LARGE Brand: ID#		100 gloves/box 10 boxes/case	20 cases	NO BID		Sterile brand 26.74		NO BID	
17	J-Fill Bath & Bowl Brand: Diversey CREW ID#3172650	NO SUBSTITUTE	2 - 84.5 oz containers /case	8 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
18	J-Fill Glass Cleaner Brand: Diversey GLANCE ID#	NO SUBSTITUTE	2 - 84.5 oz containers /case	20 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
19 *	KAIBLOOEY restroom cleaner Brand: KaiblooeY ID#	NO SUBSTITUTE	4 gallons /case	20 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM				EXPERT CHEMICAL		HP PRODUCTS		INTERBORO		UNLIMITED WAREHOUSE		UNIPAK		VALDES	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y
20	Pencil Sharpeners * Brand: KS NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 1031 *REJECT	each	12 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		14.94		NO BID		NO BID	
21	Roll Towels Brand: NPS or equal ID# 30700 SAMPLE MUST BE INCLUDED WITH BID	Six 8" rolls /case	400 cases	14.25 5,700.00		14.84		NO BID		NPS: 43.45 LAVEX: 26.45		NO BID		14.55	
22	Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White * Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 56701 *REJECT	each	4 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		70.96		NO BID		NO BID	
23	Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2 x 9 Wax Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL ID# 500/case 20 cases 10,000 TOTAL			NO BID		15.27 305.40		NO BID		1,000/cs: =10 cases: 33.97		NO BID		NO BID	
24	Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser * Brand: Aero Care NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 65855M3PB *REJECT	1,000 ml, 33.8 oz 8/case	40 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		67.59		NO BID		NO BID	
25	Sanitizer, Hand, Wall-Mount DISPENSER * Brand: Aero Care NO SUBSTITUTE ID# *REJECT	each	24 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		11.95		NO BID		NO BID	
26	Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2 Wax Brand: ID#	500/case	12 cases	NO BID		13.41 160.92		NO BID		23.69		NO BID		NO BID	
27	Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 5080-FL1000	1,000 ml/bag 6 bags/case	180 cases	23.85 4,293.00		NO BID		NO BID		44.50		NO BID		NO BID	
28	Sponges, Scrubbing Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE ID# 74	30/case	20 cases	NO BID		26.83 536.60		NO BID		38.78		NO BID		NO BID	
29	Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN ID# PGc82028	4 pads/box 6 boxes/case	40 cases	NO BID		22.62		NO BID		35.28		NO BID		21.49 859.60	

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM					ALL AMERICAN POLY		CENTRAL POLY		DYNA PAK	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL		Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No
20	Pencil Sharpeners									
*	Brand: KS NO SUBSTITUTE	each	12	each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# 1031									
	*REJECT									
21	Roll Towels									
	Brand: NPS or equal	Six 8" rolls	400	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# 30700	/case								
	SAMPLE MUST BE INCLUDED WITH BID									
22	Roll Towel 8" Dispenser - White									
*	Brand: Palmer NO SUBSTITUTE	each	4	each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# 56701									
	*REJECT									
23	Sanitary Napkin Disposal Bags - 4 x 2 x 9 Wax									
	Brand: Kotex Sanibags OR EQUAL	500/case	20	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID#			10,000 TOTAL						
24	Sanitizer, Foaming Hand, BAG for wall-mount dispenser	1,000 ml, 33.8 oz								
*	Brand: Aero Care NO SUBSTITUTE	8/case	40	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# 65855M3PB									
	*REJECT									
25	Sanitizer, Hand, Wall-Mount DISPENSER									
*	Brand: Aero Care NO SUBSTITUTE	each	24	each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID#									
	*REJECT									
26	Sanitary Napkin Disposal Kraft Bags - 11x7x3-1/2 Wax									
	Brand:	500/case	12	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID#									
27	Soap, Hand, Bag, foaming									
	Brand: InoDerm NO SUBSTITUTE	1,000 ml/bag	180	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# 5080-FL1000	6 bags/case								
28	Sponges, Scrubbing									
	Brand: 3M Scotch-Brite NO SUBSTITUTE	30/case	20	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# 74									
29	Sponges, MAGIC ERASER NO SUBSTITUTE									
	Brand: Proctor & Gamble MR. CLEAN	4 pads/box	40	cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
	ID# PGc82028	6 boxes/case								

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM				EXPERT CHEMICAL		HP PRODUCTS		INTERBORO		UNLIMITED WAREHOUSE		UNIPAK		VALDES	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority Y
30	Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes Brand: NOTE: Bid specs called for 15 cs @ 240/cs= 3,600 wiperes. Ordering 10 cases @ 360/cs = 3,600 wiperes ID#	40/tub 6 tubs/case (240/case)	15 cases 10 cases 3,600 TOTAL	NO BID		42.93 40/tub; 6 tub/cs 240 per case 0.17888 EACH		NO BID		59.69 596.90 30/tub;12 tub/cs 360 per case 0.16581 EACH		NO BID		NO BID	
31	Tissue, facial, 2 ply Brand: ID#	100/box 30 boxes/cs	240 cases	12.10		13.03		NO BID		17.28		NO BID		12.00 2,880.00	
32	Urinal Screens with block Non-Para Brand: ID# *REJECT	12/case	60 cases	NO BID		13.66		NO BID		15.23		NO BID		16.00	
33	Vacuum Brand: Panasonic ID# MC-GG283 *REJECT	each	6 each	NO BID		29.93		NO BID		289.98		NO BID		NO BID	
34	Waste Cans/Classroom Large, Metal, GREY, 15-18 gallon Brand: ID# *REJECT	each	20 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		29.85		NO BID		NO BID	
35	White Board Cleaner Brand: ID# *REJECT	1 gallon container 4 gal/case	10 case	89.00		116.56		NO BID		104.32		NO BID		NO BID	
36	Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot-for wæ 100% Rayon 24 oz. Brand: ID#		12 each	NO BID		6.36		NO BID		6.30 75.60		NO BID		NO BID	
TOTAL BID: 44,962.61				EXPERT CHEM TOTAL 12,729.60		HP PRODUCTS TOTAL 8,336.26		INTERBORO TOTAL 113.40		UNLIMITED WAREHS TOTAL 2,599.00		UNIPAK TOTAL 5,203.10		VALDES TOTAL 15,981.25	
* These items are rejected.															

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID RESULTS - OPENED 3/23/2016 @ 1:30 PM				ALL AMERICAN POLY		CENTRAL POLY		DYNA PAK	
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PACK	TOTAL	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No	Cert I: X Cert II: X	Minority No
30	Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish Wipes Brand: NOTE: Bid specs called for 15 cs @ 240/cs= 3,600 wipes. Ordering 10 cases @ 360/cs = 3,600 wipes ID#	40/tub 6 tubs/case (240/case)	15 cases 10 cases 3,600 TOTAL	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
31	Tissue, facial, 2 ply Brand: ID#	100/box 30 boxes/cs	240 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
32	Urinal Screens with block Non-Para * Brand: ID# *REJECT	12/case	60 cases	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
33	Vacuum * Brand: Panasonic NO SUBSTITUTE ID# MC-GG283 *REJECT	each	6 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
34	Waste Cans/Classroom Large, Metal, GREY, 15-18 gallon * Brand: ID# *REJECT	each	20 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
35	White Board Cleaner * Brand: ID# *REJECT	1 gallon container 4 gal/case	10 case	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
36	Wet Mop Heads-Web Foot-for wæ 100% Rayon 24 oz. Brand: ID#		12 each	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
* These items are rejected.			TOTAL BID:	44,962.61	ALL AM POLY TOTAL -	CENTRAL POLY TOTAL -	DYNA PAK TOTAL -		