
              Copy Paper Bid Results - Opened Tuesday, March 21, 2017 at 2:00 p.m
Contract 

Paper 
Group

Midland Murnane
Premier 
Paper & 

Packaging
Quill

Source 
One

School 
Specialty

Veritiv

Uniontown, 
OH

Wheeling,      
IL

Elmhurst,    
IL

Columbia,     
MO

Lincolnshire, 
IL

South Elgin, 
IL

Greenville, 
WI

Jacksonville, 
FL

Item #1  

Virgin White; 8½”x11”, 20# 400 21.35 $8,540.00 21.6612 $8,664.48 22.40 $8,960.00 22.99 $9,196.00 No Bid $23.50 $9,400.00 No Bid $21.72 $8,688.00

cases

Item #2 

Virgin Colored; 8-1/2"x11"; 20# 250 32.04 $8,010.00 31.33 $7,833.38 31.60 $7,900.00 33.90 $8,475.00 No Bid $40.50 $10,125.00 No Bid $31.55 $7,887.50

cases

Item #3     

Virgin White; 8½”x11”, 20# 760 21.35 $16,226.00 21.6612 $16,462.51 22.40 $17,024.00 22.99 $17,472.40 No Bid $23.50 $17,860.00 No Bid $21.69 $16,484.40

cases

Item #4

Virgin Colored; 8-1/2"x11"; 20# 140 32.04 $4,485.60 31.3335 $4,386.69 31.60 $4,424.00 33.90 $4,746.00 No Bid $40.50 $5,670.00 No Bid $31.55 $4,417.00

cases

Total $37,261.60 $37,347.06 $38,308.00 $39,889.40 No Bid $43,055.00 No Bid $37,476.90
*Includes 1% 

Discount
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