
 

Projectors Bid Opened Monday September 6, 2023 at 11:30am

Item #1 :Epson Powerlite 119W 
3LCD WXGA Classroom Projector 

For Addison Trail HS
Total 

 Vendor/ Location  Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price

Konica Minolta 20 $537.35 $10,747.00 20 $537.35 $10,747.00 $21,494.00

Downers Grove, IL 

 Hypertech USA 20 $638.14 $12,762.80 20 No Bid No Bid $12,762.80

Tempe, AZ

 Archangel Education Technology 20 $637.07 $12,741.40 20 637.07 $12,741.40 $25,482.80

Miami Beach, FL

 Staples 20 $529.78 $10,595.60 20 $529.78 $10,595.60 $21,191.20

Deerfield Beach, FL

 
Tiles in Styles 20 $739.30 $14,786.00 20 $739.30 $14,786.00 $29,572.00

South Holland, IL 

 B&H Photo & Electronics 20 $649.00 $12,980.00 20 No Bid No Bid $12,980.00

New York, NY

 SHI 20 $547.00 $10,940.00 20 $547.00 $10,940.00 $21,880.00

Somerset, NJ

 CDW Government 20 $499.00 $9,980.00 20 $499.00 $9,980.00 $19,960.00

Vernon Hills, IL  

Item #2 :Epson Powerlite 119W 
3LCD WXGA Classroom Projector 

for Willowbrook HS 
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