Ashphalt Seal Coating and Crack Filling and Pavement Marking at Addison Trail High School and Willowbrook High School Bid
Rejected by the Board of Education 9/12/16

Opened 9/1/16 @ 11:00 a.m.

M&J
Pavement Systems, | Murphy Pavement and | Professional | American Road DuPage R.A. Peterson - Asphalt
Inc. Sealcoating Paving Maintenenace Sur-Seal Black Pearl Pavement RAPCO Paving Co.
Addison Trail
Sealcoat, crack filling,
Areal pavement marking $13,772.00 $9,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crack filling & pavement
Area 2 marking only $16,867.00 $8,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $30,639.00 $18,000.00
Lineal Footage proposed Crack filling 23,700 lineal feet 11,600 Lineal feet
Cost per Lineal Foot Crack filling $0.60 $0.50
Willowbrook
Sealcoat, crack filling,
Areal pavement marking $31,751.00 $23,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crack filling & pavement
Area 2 marking only $13,852.00 $7,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $45,603.00 $30,700.00
Lineal Footage proposed Crack filling 27,900 lineal feet 15,000 lineal feet
Cost per Lineal Foot Crack filling $0.60 $0.50
Total Both Buildings $76,242.00 $48,700.00
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